
1 – Terms and conditions  

 
 
a. General 

This website is property of Racinal, a limited liability company, with a share capital of 
95.500 euros, registered in the Versailles Trade and Companies Register, under 
number 424 761 41900045 whose head office is located 8 rue Pierre Lamandé, 78800 

Houilles, France. Intra-community VIT Identification number: FR28450876537 00025  
 
b. Contact 

 
Phone: +33139575228. Email address: contact@racinal.com  

 
 
c. Website 

 
The publication director of this website is Mr Frédéric Sos, as managing director. This 
website is hosted by OVH SAS, a simplified joint-stock company, with a capital of 
10.069.02 euros, registered in the Lille Métropole Trade and Companies Register, 
under number 424 761 41900045, whose head office is located, 2 rue Kellermann, 
59100 Roubaix, France.  

 
 
d. Liability 

The information and links in the site are provided by Racinal for information purposes 
only. Racinal reserves the right to update, to improve and/or to modify information 

and/or any products mentioned on the website, at any time without notice. Racinal will 
not be held liable for any direct or indirect damage, included but not limited to: any 
damage due to (i) loss of use, data, profits or chance, due or linked to the use or the 
website efficiency, slow speed or the event it becomes impossible to use the website, 
or (ii) the use of the website, regardless of the basis of liability – contractual or any 
other liability.  This limitation of liability applies to any damage or prejudice caused by 
the execution default, the error, the omission, interruption, defect, delay in operation 

o transmission, computer virus or line failure, theft or destruction, or unauthorized 

access to, alteration of, or use o information under any cause of action. You hereby 
renounce all attempts to seek any legal action, and you undertake to fully indemnify 
in respect of all prejudice (costs associated with litigation, such as lawyers’ costs, 
court fees, liability of a losing party to support winners’ costs, …) coming from any 
legal action against us, from a third party, on your website use basis.  

mailto:contact@racinal.com


2 – Privacy policy 

  

Generalities 

We acknowledge the importance of rightly protecting your personal datas and to treat 
them  according  to  the  data  protection  law  of  any  any  country  where  Racinal  is 
operating. 

Racinal does not collect any personal data, nor any cookie via its website.


